
 Medline
Industries, 

Valor Elite
Supply

PCB Holdings Avante Health
Solutions

Southwest 
Medical

Steris Avantor/VWR

 Northfield 
St. Augustine, 

FL
Pewee Valley, 

KY Louisville, KY
Broken Arrow, 

OK Mentor, OH Radnor, PA
QTY Description

2 Anesthesia machine  $    9,568.64  $        5,595.00  $         5,250.00  $        9,000.00  $         8,800.00  No Bid   No Bid 
Extended  $  19,137.28  $      11,190.00  $       10,500.00  $      18,000.00  $       17,600.00 

2 Electrocautery machine  $    7,410.00  $        3,595.00  $         6,700.00  $        3,450.00  $         6,500.00  No Bid 
Extended  $  14,820.00  $        7,190.00  $       13,400.00  $        6,900.00  $       13,000.00 

1 Patient Transfer Board  $       237.80  $           375.00  No Bid   No Bid   $            637.00  $    1,232.00 
1 Roller Board  $       290.34  $           375.00  "    "  "    "  $            267.00  No Bid 

1 X-Ray stretcher  $    4,232.12 
 did not

meet specs  "    "  "    "  $         4,400.00  "    " 

1
Manual wheelchair
 with foot supports  $       128.59  $           325.00  "    "  "    "  $            220.00  "    " 

1 Transportion Gurney  $    2,891.38  $        2,995.00  "    "  "    " 
 did not

meet specs  "    " 
1 Full Body Skeleton on stand  $       507.59  $           550.00  "    "  "    "  "    " 
1 Instrument Washer  $  13,350.63  $        5,600.00  "    "  "    "  $       15,000.00  "    " 

3 Prep and Pack table  $    6,080.38 
 did not

meet specs  "    "  "    " 
 did not

meet specs  "    " 
Extended  $  18,241.14  "    "  "    "  "    " 

1 Deconamination Sink  $  10,902.96  $        5,700.00  "    "  "    "  $         9,800.00  "    " 

1 Case Cart, sm  $    2,637.62  $        1,995.00  "    "  "    " 
 did not

meet specs  "    " 
1 Case Cart, lge  $    2,941.79  $        1,995.00  "    "  "    "  $         2,000.00  "    " 
1 Free-standing Storage Cabinet  $    4,517.22  $        2,395.00  "    "  "    "  $         4,370.00  $    2,651.20 

Shipping for awarded items  $       750.00  $             95.00 
TOTAL PER VENDOR 26,988.62$  17,685.00$       10,500.00$        6,995.00$          267.00$             
GRAND TOTAL for all items 62,435.62$  
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